
 

Year 3 Topic Knowledge and Skills Organiser 

Autumn Term- Evacuation in WW2 

History 

Knowledge Skills 
To know some of the key 
events in WW2 and when 
they took place 
To know about the Blitz 
including why it occurred and 
how people kept safe. 
To know about evacuation in 
WW2. 

To create a timeline of events 
in WW2.  

 

Art 

Knowledge Skills 

To know about the artist 
David Hockney.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Creaturama- to create a junk 
model.  
To be able to paint my junk 
model. 
 
To use different material and 
medium to create a 
model/piece of art 

 

Geography 

Knowledge Skills 
To know the countries 
involved in WW2. 
 
To understand the 
differences between urban 
and rural areas. 
 

To locate the countries 
involved in WW2. 
 
To locate the UK within 
Europe. 
 
To locate Birmingham within 
the UK. 
 
 
 

 

Design Technology 

Knowledge Skills 
To know how a cams toy 
works. 
 
To know how different 
shaped cams can affect the 
movement of the follower. 
 
To know the impact of design 
and purpose when creating a 
product 

To be able to design, make 
and evaluate a cams toy. 
 
 

 


